
  

  

 

  

Weekly E-Newsletter 

 

November 28, 2024 
 

 

 

 

 

Happy Thanksgiving! 

 

  

 

 

 

 



Thanksgiving spirit shines as local 
program delivers meals to 4,000 

families 
 

  

 

Volunteers and local organizations came together Wednesday to ensure 
that everyone in the greater Scranton area will be able to enjoy a warm 
Thanksgiving meal, no matter their circumstances. 
 

The Family-to-Family Thanksgiving Food Basket Program served more 
families than ever before this year, providing each with all the grocery 
items needed to prepare a traditional Thanksgiving meal. 
 

“We are going to feed 4,000 families today, which is the most that we have 
ever had to feed,” organizer Linda Robeson said as the event began inside 
the Scranton Cultural Center. 
 

The Most Rev. Joseph C. Bambera, Bishop of Scranton, was on hand to 
provide a blessing as volunteers packaged all the food. 
 



“What a wonderful day it is and how encouraging it is for me, and this 
entire community, to see you representing all the generous hearts that 
make this possible,” Bishop Bambera told the small army of volunteers. 
“Thank you to each and every one of you, because every one of you is 
absolutely vital to this whole operation.” 

 

Click Here to Read the Full Story from The Catholic Light  
 

 

  

 

 

 

Bishop Bambera's Reflection for the 
First Sunday of Advent 

  

The first Sunday of Advent is this coming Sunday, Dec. 1, 2024.  
 

As we begin the liturgical season of Advent, Bishop Bambera will once 
again be providing video reflections to the faithful each Sunday focused on 

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFAAZ9xnFRKorbcs5IPfEB7BbPY8LJojoza3aknaoS4-EiHr7NLAgAU6HHn8OwQqi7E4OWP_ZRzfyVW2CZrgusS1yVPRnBj85hVm4n511AY_oDNhVlNZjhKCfdQ0GvNOkAejw8lso1tiXWcQV4uHejGqYfjNpxR6cepkFKd4IOLhQBQXnqlQKjz7ognsv0B8ZKhl8WEVq9viS1N-WsxF4blG2lUFxXq5i-vzEs8RGet0zpO3hvSyn2ERzsl-yfKS9EzH3TNhmxU2Tw=&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==
https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFAvjIB_jJ66MEOy2NYXy3aghYg7Xmo3ol7DpEeSaPXTbgb__LOizWevXboPAwf63gOiwp9bOb9qpC3Q9LGMB_IlhvszQ9eeo9Y5P9G2MckWBdIEaE5fX-dn-D91RRlA4Q3&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


the coming of Christ. The reflections will be available on Diocesan social 
media, the Diocese of Scranton YouTube channel, and Catholic Television. 
  
In the First Reading from the First Sunday of Advent, the prophet 
Jeremiah foretold the coming of the Messiah in these words: "He shall do 
what is right and just in the land."  
 

To watch Bishop Bambera's reflection, click on the link above or below. 

Click Here to Watch Bishop Bambera's Video Reflection for the First 
Week of Advent  

 

 

 

During Advent, Catholic Television to 

broadcast Cathedral 5 p.m. Sunday Mass and 

Evening Prayer 

  

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFApamafdlZ9EvTgOkVN_sP4MwS-bhTmFjFq7WOuv3xkkgQTvAFdu95jIIDfMDB-afEdOvSYzK6AKYT4k5W5fbzFaA4gTuO7n5PTx6qrhfQXZjfwV1NaefoNVD4VcyGTrwNDZ6KOvIvEqwy3zOJUokLbg==&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==
https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFApamafdlZ9EvTgOkVN_sP4MwS-bhTmFjFq7WOuv3xkkgQTvAFdu95jIIDfMDB-afEdOvSYzK6AKYT4k5W5fbzFaA4gTuO7n5PTx6qrhfQXZjfwV1NaefoNVD4VcyGTrwNDZ6KOvIvEqwy3zOJUokLbg==&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


With the Season of Advent beginning on Sunday, Dec. 1, the Cathedral of 
Saint Peter will once again be offering Adoration of the Blessed Sacrament 
each Sunday during Advent following the 5:00 p.m. Mass.  
 

Advent Evening Prayer and Benediction will be celebrated at 6:15 p.m. 
 

In order to help all faithful, especially those who cannot attend Mass in 
person, celebrate the coming of Christ, Catholic Television will be 
broadcasting both the 5 p.m. Mass and Evening Prayer each Sunday.  
 

We invite you to join us either in person at the Cathedral or via Catholic 
Television each Sunday evening.  

 

 

Pope urges Christians to joyfully cultivate 
fruits of the Spirit 

  

Not every Christian is called to be an apostle, prophet or evangelist, Pope 
Francis said, but all Christians can cultivate the fruits of the Holy Spirit by 
becoming “charitable, patient, humble, peacemakers.” 
 



Continuing his series of audience talks on the Holy Spirit, the pope 
explained that the fruits of the Spirit are different from charisms, which 
are given spontaneously by the Spirit for the good of the church. Instead, 
the fruits of the Spirit represent a “collaboration between grace and 
freedom,” he said. 
 

“These fruits always express the creativity of the person, in whom faith 
works through charity, sometimes in surprising and joyful ways,” he told 
visitors gathered for his general audience Nov. 27 in St. Peter’s Square. 

Click Here to Read the Full Story from Catholic News Service  
 

 

 

Final Synod document is magisterial, must be 
accepted, Pope Francis says 

  

Doubling down on the centrality of synodality in the Catholic Church, 
Pope Francis said that it is now up to local churches to accept and 
implement proposals from the final document approved the Synod of 
Bishops on synodality. 
 

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFA2s1FnMFpGSPVPWxTT8DmsE5d9zX4JSCSR0-F2f4l9RjurjL4IfeQfu_S9eNClo50D2ckvzG4BrHv2vdIhZtKOFpC5vhtYYYvXiAWIDY6o7A-EnmBHiVjcQdlMuEJak8sQ3I-wJ7cXI9J7Y_FPTBTyDfhtFL2cxnDYx9DlVRD5roXsMU4C4-JyQLQVdK7be1OTsopwVpBdR-nGeRd9LmBusR64iAShk7ipAQdF8mGlDzc76Su28tkRg==&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


Approved by the pope, the synod’s final document “participates in the 
ordinary magisterium of the successor of Peter, and as such, I ask that it 
be accepted,” the pope wrote in a note published by the Vatican Nov. 25. 
 

“Local churches and groupings of churches are now called upon to 
implement, in different contexts, the authoritative indications contained 
in the document, through the processes of discernment and decision-
making provided by law and by the document itself,” he wrote nearly a 
month after the synod’s close. 
 

The final document outlined key priorities for the church, including 
increased participation of laity through new ministries and adjusted 
governing structures, greater transparency and accountability among 
church leadership and creating space for previously marginalized groups. 

Click Here to Read the Full Story from Catholic News Service  
 

 

 

 

'It was brought back to life' 
Americans react to Notre Dame's Dec. 8 opening 

 

  

 

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFAGuWHHmso0QKUDxN-86BmcXdNEs_LvgkNF9J5wY3FtlM-hJSZuZ1SzYBvmj2prAJjM1HpJvD5apbHq8eTxR16XpPzQ7KTs1YdoVhsc6nLytFF0gk3t4l1knz4y4ll564NwuKrkLh6xf6eBbTAJTu6Rk6pN1kcBM2f6i19Bf2taHUW37ibjimEbldz3X95_ZEd45izYrXhHu_IZypNuDFy222_yhWogTNK_YpSsSfD9CauHEm7pzYgeg==&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


The devastating images – whether viewed from the banks of the Seine 
River in Paris or on millions of glowing screens around the world — 
stunned onlookers. Many wept, clutching tissues to smoke- and sorrow-
reddened eyes, others prayed aloud or in silence, some even sung hymns. 
 

It was the evening of April 15, 2019, and Notre Dame Cathedral – an 850-
plus-year-old, stone-and-mortar monument to human ingenuity and 
religious aspiration – was burning. 
 

France is a famously secular nation. Once known as “the eldest daughter 
of the church,” slightly less than half of the population call themselves 
Catholics, and only about 5% of the total population attend weekly Mass. 
 

But on that slightly chilly spring evening, such statistics didn’t matter. A 
thing of beauty was being destroyed — and it wasn’t required to be 
religious, or even Catholic, to mourn its possible extinction. 
 

“Paris without Notre Dame … madness,” one onlooker mused to CNN as it 
broadcast the conflagration. Experts later estimated the heat in the 
cathedral’s crossing reached as high as 2200 degrees Fahrenheit, hot 
enough to melt metal. 
 

Now, five years later — owing to the courage of Paris’ firefighters, nearly 
$1 billion from worldwide donors, and the skills of almost 1,000 artisans 
— Notre Dame is scheduled to reopen to the public Dec. 7-8. 

Click Here to Read the Full Story from Our Sunday Visitor  
 

 

 

 

Saint Thomas Aquinas' skull traveling to 

Pennsylvania, seven eastern states 
 

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFAQ3LA51IR2_2HRXf3cS23FqsL1apSq81cpnfrkJ6KS8ojT92Tq1iWdKDdIcb8Z13gXgW77h1DyoorPOOaa_A5ACKfU1-YEOEiBKcGFB8iHP8s4wSrXy1fc2Jky6LiBOEGOH-uhAwt0Oes0b7XwHzPKqDyGL8hrrFOfQs0kV3k60yFrkCSjy6eNqiWtoPM9fbOOV1BQlhAV5RxngPeLIql0IFUqE94pdxhkJj9icEAfaD2AnbQuKTqia_MFrTl1D9rQYbQ_OQAl04=&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


  

A touring relic will give the faithful in Washington and seven states a rare 
opportunity to venerate St. Thomas Aquinas, one of the greatest Christian 
theologians. 
 

The skull of St. Thomas, which has been on tour in Europe for the past 
year for observances marking the jubilees of his canonization (700 years 
in 2023), death (750 years in 2024) and birth (800 years in 2025) will be 
in Washington for two days of veneration Nov. 29 and 30. 
 

Washington is the first of its stops in 10 U.S. cities through Dec. 18. 

Click Here to Read the Full Story from Our Sunday Visitor  
 

 

 

 

 

U.S. Bishops announce Prayer Vigil for Life to 

take place Jan. 23-24 
 

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFARroSNdAQtpXbr04Nq4Am4_yPgovS4_z5zZzIBMjq7p6dg9niBlf5U6KjtXH_95lqNhfJO5zGGnuheom2t9llrAP_94-G9A7IiwCAC45nlnbTyCow-hC1Prxcd5X_OTKSodQ4aSwzz65w6hUnEqMr8-HrSbQWzZm5pr5OaIZX9QEHz2XNXAbWlbXbwktiFdP_9yhydy116eErBgmthgh7-670w3YyYi5tpmXEKlWuwM13L5MXuCvsy-qQjZMBm0sd&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


  

 

The annual Prayer Vigil for Life will take place Jan. 23-24, 2025, the U.S. 
bishops’ conference announced Nov. 22. 
 

The event is hosted each January by the U.S. Conference of Catholic 
Bishops’ Pro-Life Secretariat, the Basilica of the National Shrine of the 
Immaculate Conception in Washington and The Catholic University of 
America’s Office of Campus Ministry. It takes place on the eve of the 
March for Life, an annual protest of the 1973 Roe v. Wade decision by the 
U.S. Supreme Court, which was overturned in 2022. 
 

The 52nd National March for Life will take place Jan. 24, 2025. 
 

“I enthusiastically invite Catholics from all around the country to join me 
in-person or virtually, in praying for an end to abortion and building up a 
culture of life,” said Bishop Daniel E. Thomas of Toledo, Ohio, chairman 
of the USCCB’s Committee on Pro-Life Activities, in the USCCB’s 
statement announcing the dates. 

Click Here to Read the Full Story from Our Sunday Visitor  
 

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5YNkgY4kLaFAk5k6UInV9sy8Hum-XwOPzGA5oAINYORPI74qXbm7vUaI7VMslSV69v6OwIJpUWDX6SXrdFOk7oNCes_zfDyUQ51dQkffhILixvjD5j2wUXBj2V9BgqGTyRMDVgONvqRBBR6bMlUxnd-J8W1Ose1X3MD-X0tgenCkWLmf0mZZOpCmR6LWen1GwisIrqmmdLzL1KihfD4xVd_Vgr-fIVBoulXWwBhRtwqb_ltTuKZZuHwlmD4SZD0Sae0k0gTJPZB8&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


 

 

Support the 2024 Catholic Ministries 
Appeal! 

  

 

Click Here to Answer 'Our Call to Serve' Today!  
 

 

 

 

 

   

Follow us on Social Media...  
 

         
 

Diocese of Scranton 

300 Wyoming Avenue,  

https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5XoeZEmT3YIuuxZDupYbQtgq2t-4WJL4VOmUeQIG6gay1v0zP61TA6R7l_jipB5iuzPVcfeZJH0AwXl1VY5rb_UcWF7XJSzfmzvGw6ajU07rLyIZIy-tH6SCmQ73rdyQbadhyNFu7oK4PzaVcZqC88uq9BDrOjhuHw==&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==
https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5TFi2r_lOmvt610y3PpV9iLEx309GOmP_UgIV_UX23TD3ATRCTROy8PaZEKWVHpnldOAMBkxvaq9S_dYJ25pPnM83Vf6KfJfshMwhusHAsZ7gC5qDC1ylcPamLQi_KJzZA==&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==
https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5dIAKXrHeo23trN-YkdbOiJwndPl2PqHjfTcDu9hnwVUSpEn6btOSF5sFQLMb_LRAUa10hhh4KhKDjb-5IScu8zXsRFV5Ck-aj3a_sFMYx4l&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==
https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5WgkXhga8ZC5YIw96R3qCNwfX0I9RG1126q0Jn_2c3oF8hzogrQYoEswztDObvD3mfV3u_jmv1dSid_4-bK_6XR1wEGnBMyaIq7vXIwfra99zYe5xVhhLguE7NllIR8iYQ==&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==
https://pypqh5dab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001Nes9qX3benw50XG61-PoritVjLqjmb_rH_4plxQDvTblZJ-7y0HT5WgkXhga8ZC57QDi-vN4Czphhz2fKR-rdBBvP0pQ4ukUHnN5u96-cR7s_yw6P9wj65Vgp2MLRg1YcQ3O-U4MrID7ypSYYYRKPNhOonG_KxuXr1wy9c8rCas=&c=m3gL2uOZlZHsOH6VLDYkJzxlTGPLa_ae3iP_K2Rk9uk4-UpbbSiDqg==&ch=GUQpSkIkHnFJfWCsSC0XsIIK7vZqoRFKrs8lHdjvBrQ48VYxBpySOg==


Scranton, PA 18503-1279 

(570) 207-2238 

www.dioceseofscranton.org 
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